
Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
1

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 14.50 12.50 27.00 1 16.75 14.75 31.50 2 19.00 17.00 36.00 3

Any County Road 14.50 15.00 29.50 1 16.75 14.75 31.50 2 19.00 21.00 40.00 3

Stockpile 14.50 14.00 28.50 1 16.75 12.75 29.50 2 19.00 19.00 38.00 4

Any County Road 14.50 17.50 32.00 2 16.75 12.75 29.50 1 19.00 22.00 41.00 4

Stockpile 14.50 14.00 28.50 1 16.75 14.75 31.50 2 19.00 22.00 41.00 4

Any County Road 14.50 16.25 30.75 1 16.75 14.75 31.50 2 19.00 22.00 41.00 4

Stockpile 14.50 16.00 30.50 1 16.75 14.75 31.50 2 19.00 21.00 40.00 4

Stockpile 14.50 18.50 33.00 2 16.75 15.75 32.50 1 19.00 25.00 44.00 4

Any County Road 14.50 19.50 34.00 2 16.75 15.75 32.50 1 19.00 25.00 44.00 4

Stockpile ---------- ------- ---------- ---------- ----------- -----------

Pick-Up 14.00 ******** 16.75 ******** 19.00 *********

Pick-Up Location

Not needed

Bull Rock, Clean

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 550

ABN Consturction Prihoda Gravel Co. Allstar Mterials LLC

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

1 2 3

RF Pit AltAir Stratton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not needed Not needed

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
2

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 25.00 24.00 49.00 5 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 16.50 36.00 4

Any County Road 25.00 25.00 50.00 5 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 16.50 36.00 4

Stockpile 25.00 26.00 51.00 6 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 17.50 37.00 3

Any County Road 25.00 27.00 52.00 6 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 17.50 37.00 3

Stockpile 25.00 25.00 50.00 6 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 16.50 36.00 3

Any County Road 25.00 26.00 51.00 6 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 16.50 36.00 3

Stockpile 25.00 27.00 52.00 6 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 18.50 38.00 3

Stockpile 25.00 30.00 55.00 5 44.50 44.50 4 19.50 18.50 38.00 3

Any County Road 25.00 31.00 56.00 6 44.50 44.50 5 19.50 18.50 38.00 3

Stockpile ---------- ------- ---------- ------- ---------- -------

Pick-Up 25.00 ******** 44.50 ******** NB *********

Pick-Up Location

 (CONTINUED)                                        

Bull Rock, Clean

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 550

Colorado Materials - Hunter TX Colorado Material - Nursery TX Neumann Welding, INC

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

4 5 ---------------

Hunter, TX Nursery, TX

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not needed Not needed Not needed

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
3

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 12.50 12.50 25.00 1 14.75 14.75 29.50 3 12.00 15.00 27.00 2

Any County Road 12.50 15.50 28.00 2 14.75 14.75 29.50 3 12.00 15.00 27.00 1

Stockpile 12.50 14.00 26.50 1 14.75 12.75 27.50 2 12.00 19.00 31.00 3

Any County Road 12.50 16.50 29.00 2 14.75 13.75 28.50 1 12.00 22.00 34.00 4

Stockpile 12.50 13.75 26.25 1 14.75 14.75 29.50 2 12.00 22.00 34.00 4

Any County Road 12.50 16.25 28.75 1 14.75 14.75 29.50 2 12.00 22.00 34.00 4

Stockpile 12.50 16.00 28.50 1 14.75 14.75 29.50 2 12.00 21.00 33.00 3

Stockpile 12.50 16.50 29.00 1 14.75 15.75 30.50 2 12.00 21.00 33.00 3

Any County Road 12.50 19.50 32.00 2 14.75 15.75 30.50 1 12.00 25.00 37.00 4

Stockpile ------- 14.75 14.75 29.50 1 12.00 19.00 31.00 2

Pick-Up 12.50 ******** 14.75 ******** 12.00 *********

Pick-Up Location

NO BID

RF Pit AltAir Stratton

ABN Consturction Phrihoda Gravel Co Allstar Mterials LLC

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

2 3 1

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Bull Rock, with Clay

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 550

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
4

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 16.00 16.50 32.50 4

Any County Road 16.00 16.50 32.50 4

Stockpile 16.00 17.50 33.50 4

Any County Road 16.00 17.50 33.50 3

Stockpile 16.00 16.50 32.50 3

Any County Road 16.00 16.50 32.50 3

Stockpile 16.00 18.50 34.50 4

Stockpile 16.00 18.50 34.50 4

Any County Road 16.00 18.50 34.50 3

Stockpile ---------- -------

Pick-Up NB ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

---------------

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not needed

(CONTINUED)                                          

Bull Rock, with Clay

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 550

Neumann Welding Inc*

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
5

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile** 9.50 12.25 21.75 3 6.25 14.50 20.75 2 9.00 12.00 21.00 1

Any County Road** 9.50 15.25 24.75 3 6.25 15.50 21.75 2 9.00 15.00 24.00 1

Stockpile 9.50 13.50 23.00 3 6.25 12.50 18.75 1 9.00 13.00 22.00 2

Any County Road 9.50 16.50 26.00 3 6.25 13.75 20.00 1 9.00 16.00 25.00 2

Stockpile 9.50 13.50 23.00 3 6.25 14.50 20.75 1 9.00 13.00 22.00 2

Any County Road 9.50 16.25 25.75 4 6.25 15.25 21.50 9.00 15.25 24.25 2

Stockpile 9.50 16.00 25.50 3 6.25 14.75 21.00 1 9.00 16.00 25.00 2

Stockpile 9.50 16.50 26.00 3 6.25 15.75 22.00 1 9.00 16.00 25.00 2

Any County Road 9.50 19.50 29.00 4 6.25 16.75 23.00 1 9.00 18.00 27.00 2

Stockpile NB NB ------- 6.25 14.75 21.00 1 9.00 19.00 28.00 3

Pick-Up 9.50 ****** 6.25 ******* 9.00 *********

Pick-Up Location

3 1 2

RF Pit AltAir Stratton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Gravel, Pit Run 

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 8,900 

ABN Consturction Phrihoda Gravel Co Allstar Mterials LLC

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
6

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 9.00 16.50 25.50 4

Any County Road 9.00 16.50 25.50 4

Stockpile 9.00 17.50 26.50 4

Any County Road 9.00 17.50 26.50 4

Stockpile 9.00 16.50 25.50 4

Any County Road 9.00 16.50 25.50 3

Stockpile 9.00 18.50 27.50 4

Stockpile 9.00 18.50 27.50 4

Any County Road 9.00 18.50 27.50 3

Stockpile 9.00 18.50 27.50 2

Pick-Up NB ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

---------

(CONTINUED)                                    

Gravel, Pit Run 

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 8,900 

Neumann Welding Inc*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
7

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 12.50 12.00 24.50 1 14.75 14.75 29.50 3 6.50 24.00 30.50 4

Any County Road 12.50 15.50 28.00 2 14.75 15.50 30.25 3 6.50 25.00 31.50 4

Stockpile 12.50 14.75 27.25 2 14.75 12.75 27.50 3 6.50 26.00 32.50 4

Any County Road 12.50 17.00 29.50 3 14.75 13.75 28.50 2 6.50 27.00 33.50 4

Stockpile 12.50 12.50 25.00 1 14.75 15.00 29.75 3 6.50 25.00 31.50 4

Any County Road 12.50 16.25 28.75 2 14.75 15.25 30.00 3 6.50 26.00 32.50 4

Stockpile 12.50 17.00 29.50 2 14.75 14.75 29.50 3 6.50 27.00 33.50 4

Stockpile 12.50 17.00 29.50 2 14.75 15.75 30.50 3 6.50 30.00 36.50 4

Any County Road 12.50 20.00 32.50 3 14.75 16.75 31.50 2 6.50 31.00 37.50 4

Stockpile NB NB NB ------- 14.25 14.75 29.00 2 6.50 25.00 31.50 3

Pick-Up** 12.50 ******** 14.75 ******** 6.50 *********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Processed Flexible Base Grade 3

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity:3500

ABN Consturction Prihoda Gravel Co. Colorado Materials - Hunter, TX

1 2 3

RF Pit AltAir Hunter, TX

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
8

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 2 0.00

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 2 0.00

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 0.00

Pick-Up 26.50 ******** ******** *********

Pick-Up Location

CONTINUED - Processed Flexible Base 

Grade 3

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity:3500

Colorado Materials - Nursery TX

Nursery, TX

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

4

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
9

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 9.50 12.25 21.75 2 9.00 12.00 21.00 1 17.50 16.50 34.00 3

Any County Road 9.50 15.25 24.75 2 9.00 15.50 24.50 1 17.50 16.50 34.00 3

Stockpile 9.50 13.50 23.00 2 9.00 13.00 22.00 1 17.50 17.50 35.00 3

Any County Road 9.50 16.50 26.00 2 9.00 16.00 25.00 1 17.50 17.50 35.00 3

Stockpile 9.50 13.50 23.00 2 9.00 12.50 21.50 1 17.50 16.50 34.00 3

Any County Road 9.50 16.25 25.75 2 9.00 16.00 25.00 1 17.50 16.50 34.00 3

Stockpile 9.50 16.00 25.50 2 9.00 16.00 25.00 1 17.50 18.50 36.00 3

Stockpile 9.50 16.50 26.00 1 9.00 19.50 28.50 2 17.50 18.50 36.00 3

Any County Road 9.50 19.50 29.00 2 9.00 19.50 28.50 1 17.50 18.50 36.00 3

Stockpile NB NB NB ------- 9.00 16.00 25.00 1 17.50 18.50 36.00 2

Pick-Up 9.50 ******* 9.00 ******** NB ********

Pick-Up Location

Neumann Welding, INC*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

2 1 ---------

RF Pit Stratton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Gravel, Post Oak Pit Run w/Red Clay

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 6750

ABN Consturction Allstar Materials

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
10

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 12.50 12.00 24.50 2 8.25 17.75 26.00 3 12.25 12.00 24.25 1

Any County Road 12.50 15.50 28.00 4 8.25 14.75 23.00 1 12.25 15.50 27.75 3

Stockpile 12.50 14.75 27.25 3 8.25 12.75 21.00 1 12.25 14.50 26.75 2

Any County Road 12.50 17.00 29.50 4 8.25 13.75 22.00 1 12.25 17.00 29.25 3

Stockpile 12.50 12.50 25.00 3 8.25 15.00 23.25 1 12.25 12.50 24.75 2

Any County Road 12.50 16.25 28.75 4 8.25 15.25 23.50 1 12.25 16.00 28.25 3

Stockpile 12.50 17.00 29.50 4 8.25 14.75 23.00 1 12.25 16.50 28.75 2

Stockpile 12.50 17.00 29.50 4 8.25 15.75 24.00 1 12.25 17.00 29.25 2

Any County Road 12.50 20.00 32.50 4 8.25 16.75 25.00 1 12.25 19.50 31.75 3

Stockpile NB NB NB ------- 8.25 14.75 23.00 1 12.25 16.50 28.75 2

Pick-Up 12.50 ******** 8.25 ******** 12.25 *********

Pick-Up Location RF Pit AltAir Stratton

3 1 2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Gravel, Screened 

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 7,500

ABN Consturction Prihoda Gravel Co.
Allstar Materials

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
11

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 11.00 16.50 27.50 4

Any County Road 11.00 16.50 27.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 17.50 28.50 4

Any County Road 11.00 17.50 28.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 16.50 27.50 4

Any County Road 11.00 16.50 27.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 18.50 29.50 3

Stockpile 11.00 18.50 29.50 3

Any County Road 11.00 18.50 29.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 18.50 29.50 3

Pick-Up NB ********

Pick-Up Location

------------

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED)                                    

Gravel, Screened 

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 7,500

Neumann Welding Inc*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
12

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile ** 12.50 12.00 24.50 2 8.25 14.75 23.00 3 12.25 12.00 24.25 1

Any County Road ** 12.50 15.50 28.00 2 8.25 14.75 23.00 3 12.25 15.50 27.75 1

Stockpile 12.50 14.75 27.25 3 8.25 12.75 21.00 1 12.25 14.50 26.75 2

Any County Road 12.50 17.00 29.50 4 8.25 13.75 22.00 1 12.25 17.00 29.25 3

Stockpile 12.50 12.50 25.00 3 8.25 15.00 23.25 1 12.25 12.50 24.75 2

Any County Road 12.50 16.25 28.75 4 8.25 15.25 23.50 1 12.25 16.00 28.25 3

Stockpile 12.50 17.00 29.50 4 8.25 14.75 23.00 1 12.25 16.50 28.75 2

Stockpile 12.50 17.00 29.50 4 8.25 15.75 24.00 1 12.25 17.00 29.25 2

Any County Road 12.50 20.00 32.50 4 8.25 16.75 25.00 1 12.25 19.50 31.75 3

Stockpile NB NB NB ------- 8.25 14.75 23.00 1 12.25 16.50 28.75 2

Pick-Up 12.50 ******** 8.25 ******** 12.25 *********

Pick -Up Precinct #1 12.50 ******** 8.25 ******** 12.25 *********

Pick-Up Location

3 1 2

RF Pit AltAir Stratton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Gravel, Screened w/Red Clay

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 11500

ABN Consturction Prihoda Gravel Co.
Allstar Materials

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

2 3 1

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
13

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 11.00 16.50 27.50 4

Any County Road 11.00 16.50 27.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 17.50 28.50 4

Any County Road 11.00 17.50 28.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 16.50 27.50 4

Any County Road 11.00 16.50 27.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 18.50 29.50 3

Stockpile 11.00 18.50 29.50 3

Any County Road 11.00 18.50 29.50 2

Stockpile 11.00 18.50 29.50 3

Pick-Up NB ********

Pick -Up Precinct #1 NB ********

Pick-Up Location

----------

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

----------

(CONTINUED)                                    

Gravel, Screened w/Red Clay

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 11500

Neumann Welding Inc*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
14

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile

Any County Road

Stockpile

Any County Road

Stockpile

Any County Road

Stockpile

Stockpile

Any County Road

Stockpile

Pick-Up ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Lime, Hi-Cal Hydrated, Bagged

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 395

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
15

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Lime, Hydrated, Not-Bagged

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 625

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
16

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 8.70 24.50 33.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 24.00 31.00 2

Any County Road 8.70 24.50 33.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 25.00 32.00 2

Stockpile 8.70 25.50 34.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 26.00 33.00 2

Any County Road 8.70 25.50 34.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 27.00 34.00 2

Stockpile 8.70 24.50 33.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 25.00 32.00 2

Any County Road 8.70 24.50 33.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 26.00 33.00 2

Stockpile 8.70 26.50 35.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 27.00 34.00 2

Stockpile 8.70 28.50 37.20 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 30.00 37.00 2

Any County Road 8.70 28.50 37.20 1 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 31.00 38.00 2

Stockpile 8.70 25.00 33.70 3 NB NB NB --------- 7.00 25.00 32.00 1

Pick-Up ** 45.85 ******** 36.25 ******* 7.00 *********

Pick-Up Location

2 3 4

MCM Yard AltAir Hunter, TX

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Limestone, 3/4" to Dust

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 2,100

Matagorda Construction & Materials Prihoda Gravel Co. Colorado Materials - Hunter, TX

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
17

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 9.50 29.00 38.50 4 12.00 18.90 30.90 1

Any County Road 9.50 29.00 38.50 4 12.00 19.90 31.90 1

Stockpile 9.50 30.00 39.50 4 12.00 19.40 31.40 1

Any County Road 9.50 30.00 39.50 4 12.00 20.40 32.40 1

Stockpile 9.50 29.00 38.50 4 12.00 18.90 30.90 1

Any County Road 9.50 29.00 38.50 4 12.00 19.90 31.90 1

Stockpile 9.50 31.50 41.00 4 12.00 21.00 33.00 1

Stockpile 9.50 31.50 41.00 4 12.00 22.75 34.75 1

Any County Road 9.50 31.50 41.00 4 12.00 26.00 38.00 3

Stockpile 9.50 31.50 41.00 4 12.00 20.00 32.00 2

Pick-Up ** NB ******** 31.50 ********

Pick-Up Location

------------------------- 1

Newtaiton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED)                                         

Limestone, 3/4" to Dust

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 2,100

Neumann Welding Inc* Quality Hot Mix *

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
18

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 7.85 24.50 32.35 4 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 24.00 30.50 2

Any County Road 7.85 24.50 32.35 4 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 25.00 31.50 2

Stockpile 7.85 25.50 33.35 4 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 26.00 32.50 3

Any County Road 7.85 25.50 33.35 3 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 27.00 33.50 4

Stockpile 7.85 24.50 32.35 4 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 25.00 31.50 3

Any County Road 7.85 24.50 32.35 3 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 26.00 32.50 4

Stockpile 7.85 26.50 34.35 4 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 27.00 33.50 3

Stockpile 7.85 28.50 36.35 3 NB NB NB ---------- 7.00 30.00 37.00 4

Any County Road 7.85 28.50 36.35 2 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 31.00 37.50 3

Stockpile 7.85 25.00 32.85 4 NB NB NB ---------- 6.50 25.00 31.50 2

Pick-Up ** 45.00 ******** 29.75 ******** 6.50 *********

Pick-Up Location

4 2 5

MCM Yard AltAir Hunter, TX

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Limestone, 1 1/2" to 1"

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 3300

Matagorda Construction & Materials Prihoda Gravel Co. Colorado Materials - Hunter, TX

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
19

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 16.50 52.00 5 12.00 18.50 30.50 3

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 16.50 52.00 5 12.00 19.50 31.50 3

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 17.50 53.00 5 12.00 19.50 31.50 2

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 17.50 53.00 5 12.00 20.50 32.50 2

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 16.50 52.00 5 12.00 18.00 30.00 2

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 16.50 52.00 5 12.00 19.00 31.00 2

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 18.50 54.00 5 12.00 21.00 33.00 2

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 18.50 54.00 5 12.00 22.50 34.50 2

Any County Road 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 18.50 54.00 5 12.00 27.00 39.00 4

Stockpile 26.50 26.50 1 35.50 18.50 54.00 5 12.00 19.50 31.50 3

Pick-Up ** 26.50 ******** NB ******** 31.50 *********

Pick-Up Location

1 -------------------------- 3

Nursery, TX Newtaiton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED)                              

Limestone, 1 1/2" to 1"

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 3300

Colorado Materials - Nursery, TX Neumann Welding Inc* Quality Hot Mix *

Precinct #1

Precinct #2
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 4.00 24.00 28.00 1 9.50 29.00 38.50 3 10.00 19.00 29.00 2

Any County Road 4.00 25.00 29.00 1 9.50 29.00 38.50 3 10.00 20.00 30.00 2

Stockpile 4.00 26.00 30.00 1 9.50 30.00 39.50 3 10.00 20.00 30.00 2

Any County Road 4.00 27.00 31.00 1 9.50 30.00 39.50 3 10.00 21.00 31.00 2

Stockpile 4.00 25.00 29.00 1 9.50 29.00 38.50 3 10.00 20.00 30.00 2

Any County Road 4.00 26.00 30.00 1 9.50 29.00 38.50 3 10.00 21.00 31.00 2

Stockpile 4.00 27.00 31.00 1 9.50 31.50 41.00 3 10.00 22.00 32.00 2

Stockpile 4.00 30.00 34.00 1 9.50 31.50 41.00 3 10.00 25.00 35.00 2

Any County Road 4.00 31.00 35.00 1 9.50 31.50 41.00 3 10.00 28.00 38.00 2

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up ** 4.00 ******** NB ******** 32.00 *********

Pick-Up Location Hunter TX Newtaiton

2 -------------------------- 1

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Limestone, Dust

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 450

Colorado Materials - Hunter TX Neumann Welding Inc* Quality Hot Mix *

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Not Needed Not Needed Not Needed
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 26.30 24.50 50.80 3 30.00 24.00 54.00 4 50.00 50.00 2

Any County Road 26.30 24.50 50.80 3 30.00 25.00 55.00 4 50.00 50.00 2

Stockpile 26.30 25.50 51.80 3 30.00 26.00 56.00 4 50.00 50.00 1

Any County Road 26.30 25.50 51.80 3 30.00 27.00 57.00 4 50.00 50.00 1

Stockpile 26.30 24.50 50.80 3 30.00 25.00 55.00 4 50.00 50.00 2

Any County Road 26.30 24.50 50.80 3 30.00 26.00 56.00 4 50.00 50.00 2

Stockpile 36.30 26.50 62.80 4 30.00 27.00 57.00 3 50.00 50.00 1

Stockpile 26.30 28.50 54.80 3 30.00 30.00 60.00 4 50.00 50.00 1

Any County Road 26.30 28.50 54.80 3 30.00 31.00 61.00 4 50.00 50.00 1

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up ** 64.10 ******** 30.00 ******** 50.00 *********

Pick-Up Location

No Backup No Backup 1

Hunter TX Nursery, TX

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not Needed Not Needed Not Needed

Limestone, Grade 5 (Ice Rock)

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 275

Matagorda Construction & Materials Colorado Materials - Hunter TX Colorado Materials - Nursery, TX

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
22

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 20.00 50.00 1

Any County Road 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 20.00 50.00 1

Stockpile 54.50 17.50 72.00 5 30.00 21.00 51.00 2

Any County Road 54.50 17.50 72.00 5 30.00 21.00 51.00 2

Stockpile 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 20.00 50.00 1

Any County Road 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 20.00 50.00 1

Stockpile 54.50 18.50 73.00 5 30.00 21.00 51.00 2

Stockpile 54.50 18.50 73.00 5 30.00 21.00 51.00 2

Any County Road 54.50 18.50 73.00 5 30.00 23.00 53.00 2

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up ** NB ******** 53.00 ********

Pick-Up Location

-------------------------- No Backup

Newtaiton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED)                                          

Limestone, Grade 5 (Ice Rock)

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 275

Neumann Welding Inc* Quality Hot Mix*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Not Needed Not Needed Not Needed
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 26.30 24.50 50.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 24.00 54.00 3

Any County Road 26.30 25.50 51.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 25.00 55.00 3

Stockpile 26.30 25.50 51.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 26.00 56.00 3

Any County Road 26.30 25.50 51.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 27.00 57.00 3

Stockpile 26.30 24.50 50.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 25.00 55.00 3

Any County Road 26.30 24.50 50.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 26.00 56.00 3

Stockpile 26.30 26.50 52.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 27.00 57.00 3

Stockpile 26.30 28.50 54.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 30.00 60.00 3

Any County Road 26.30 28.50 54.80 2 25.00 40.00 65.00 4 30.00 31.00 61.00 3

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up ** 64.10 ******** 25.00 ******** 30.00 *********
Pick-Up Location

4 3 2
MCM Yard New Brunsfels Hunter, TX

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not Needed Not Needed Not Needed

Limestone, Non-Coated, Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 10,000

Matagorda Construction & Materials Brauntex Materials Inc Colorado Materials - Hunter, TX

Precinct #1

Precinct #2
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 18.50 48.50 1

Any County Road 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 18.50 48.50 1

Stockpile 54.50 17.50 72.00 5 30.00 19.00 49.00 1

Any County Road 54.50 17.50 72.00 5 30.00 19.00 49.00 1

Stockpile 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 19.00 49.00 1

Any County Road 54.50 16.50 71.00 5 30.00 19.00 49.00 1

Stockpile 54.50 18.50 73.00 5 30.00 20.00 50.00 1

Stockpile 54.50 18.50 73.00 5 30.00 22.00 52.00 1

Any County Road 54.50 18.50 73.00 5 30.00 22.00 52.00 1

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up ** NB ******** 53.00 ********

Pick-Up Location

-------------------------- 1

Newtaiton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED) Limestone, Non-Coated, 

Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity:10000

Neumann Welding Inc* Quality Hot Mix*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Not Needed Not Needed
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 45.00 40.00 85.00 3 55.00 24.00 79.00 2 72.50 16.50 89.00 4
Any County Road 45.00 40.00 85.00 3 55.00 25.00 80.00 2 72.50 16.50 89.00 4

Stockpile 45.00 40.00 85.00 3 55.00 26.00 81.00 2 72.50 17.50 90.00 4

Any County Road 45.00 40.00 85.00 3 55.00 27.00 82.00 2 72.50 17.50 90.00 4

Stockpile 45.00 40.00 85.00 3 55.00 25.00 80.00 2 72.50 16.50 89.00 4
Any County Road 45.00 40.00 85.00 3 55.00 26.00 81.00 2 72.50 16.50 89.00 4

Stockpile 45.00 40.00 85.00 3 55.00 27.00 82.00 2 72.50 18.50 91.00 4

Stockpile 45.00 40.00 85.00 2 55.00 30.00 85.00 3 72.50 18.50 91.00 4

Any County Road 45.00 40.00 85.00 55.00 31.00 86.00 72.50 18.50 91.00

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up ** 45.00 ******** 55.00 ******** NB *********

Pick-Up Location

No Backup No Backup --------------------------

1504 Wald Rd, New Brunfels, TX 78132 Hunter, TX

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not Needed Not Needed Not Needed

Limestone, Pre-Coated Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,050

Brauntex Materials Inc Colorado Materials - Hunter TX Neumann Welding INC*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 67.00 11.50 78.50 1

Any County Road 67.00 12.50 79.50 1

Stockpile 67.00 12.00 79.00 1
Any County Road 67.00 13.00 80.00 1

Stockpile 67.00 11.50 78.50 1

Any County Road 67.00 12.50 79.50 1

Stockpile 67.00 12.00 79.00 1

Stockpile 67.00 13.50 80.50 1

Any County Road 67.00 68.00 135.00

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up** 67.00 ********

Pick-Up Location

1

Newtaiton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED)                           

Limestone, Pre-Coated Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,050

Quality Hot Mix *

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Not Needed
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 151.80 261.80 2 80.00 24.00 104.00 No Backup

Any County Road 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 151.80 261.80 2 80.00 25.00 105.00 No Backup

Stockpile 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 149.90 259.90 2 80.00 26.00 106.00 No Backup

Any County Road 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 149.90 259.90 2 80.00 27.00 107.00 No Backup

Stockpile 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 152.94 262.94 1 80.00 25.00 105.00 2

Any County Road 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 152.94 262.94 No Backup 80.00 26.00 106.00 2

Stockpile 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 153.32 263.32 1 80.00 27.00 107.00 No Backup

Stockpile 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 153.32 263.32 1 80.00 30.00 110.00 No Backup

Any County Road 65.00 40.00 105.00 No Backup 110.00 153.32 263.32 1 80.00 31.00 111.00 3

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up 65.00 ******** 110.00 ******** 80.00 *********

Pick-Up Location

No Backup 1 No Backup

New Brunsfels 22010 Fairgrounds RD, Hempstead, TX 77445 Hunter, TX

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not Needed Not Needed Not Needed

Mix, Cold **

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,650

Brauntex Materials Inc Waller County Asphalt Colorado Materials - Hunter, TX

Precinct #1

Precinct #2
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 88.50 29.00 117.50 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 1

Any County Road 88.50 29.00 117.50 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 1

Stockpile 88.50 30.00 118.50 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 2
Any County Road 88.50 30.00 118.50 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 2

Stockpile 88.50 29.00 117.50 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 3

Any County Road 88.50 29.00 117.50 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 3

Stockpile 88.50 31.50 120.00 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 2

Stockpile 88.50 31.50 120.00 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 2

Any County Road 88.50 31.50 120.00 4 95.00 10.00 105.00 2

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up NB ******** 95.00 *******

Pick-Up Location

--------------------------- 2

Newtaiton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED) Mix, Cold **

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,650

Neumann Welding INc Quality Hot Mix*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Not Needed Not Needed
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 85.00 11.00 96.00 2 87.50 16.50 104.00 3 85.00 10.00 95.00 1

Any County Road 85.00 13.00 98.00 2 87.50 16.50 104.00 3 85.00 11.00 96.00 1

Stockpile 85.00 13.00 98.00 2 87.50 17.50 105.00 3 85.00 12.00 97.00 1
Any County Road 85.00 15.00 100.00 2 87.50 17.50 105.00 3 85.00 13.00 98.00 1

Stockpile 85.00 12.50 97.50 2 87.50 16.50 104.00 3 85.00 10.00 95.00 1

Any County Road 85.00 14.50 99.50 2 87.50 16.50 104.00 3 85.00 11.00 96.00 1

Stockpile 85.00 14.00 99.00 2 87.50 18.50 106.00 3 85.00 13.00 98.00 1

Stockpile 85.00 15.50 100.50 2 87.50 18.50 106.00 3 85.00 14.00 99.00 1

Any County Road 85.00 17.50 102.50 2 87.50 18.50 106.00 3 85.00 15.00 100.00 1

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up ** 85.00 ******** NB ******** 85.00 *********

Pick-Up Location

2 -------------------------- 1

Nursery, TX Newtaiton

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Not Needed Not Needed Not Needed

Mix, Hot

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 700

Colorado Materials - Nursery, TX
Neumann Welding INC*

Quality Hot Mix *

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
30

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Any County Road 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Stockpile 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Any County Road 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Stockpile 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Any County Road 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Stockpile 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Stockpile 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Any County Road 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Stockpile 2.55 2.74 5.29 2 2.55 2.74 5.29 1 2.45 0.23 2.68 1

Pick-Up 2.65 ******** 2.65 ******** 2.45 *********

Pick-Up Location

2 1 1

100 Asphalt Lane, Shepherd, TX 77371 100 Asphalt Lane, Shepard, TX 77371 6746 Up River Rd, Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

5.29

Transfer Station

Pickup

Emulsion, Asphalt

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 16000

Cleveland Asphalt Products Inc -CRS -2* Cleveland Asphalt Products Inc - SS-1* Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Inc CRS-2 *

Precinct #1

Precinct #2
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Stabilizer, Portland Cement (3%) with 

Application

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 500

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Precinct #2
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 26.50 0.00 26.50 2 18.50 18.50 1

Any County Road 26.50 0.00 26.50 1 NB NB -------

Stockpile 26.50 0.00 26.50 2 18.50 18.50 1

Any County Road 26.50 0.00 26.50 1 NB NB -------

Stockpile 26.50 0.00 26.50 2 18.50 18.50 1

Any County Road 26.50 0.00 26.50 1 NB NB -------

Stockpile 26.50 0.00 26.50 2 18.50 18.50 1

Stockpile 26.50 0.00 26.50 2 18.50 18.50 1

Any County Road 26.50 0.00 26.50 1 NB NB -------

Stockpile -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up** -------- -------- --------

Pick-Up Location Mission TX

Rejected No Bid

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Stabilizer, Sodium Silicate 40+%

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 12960

Charter Trading Corporation JACO Industrial Supply Inc*

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Not Needed Not Needed

Bid Results FY 2026



Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2026 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
33

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Any County Road 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Stockpile 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Any County Road 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Stockpile 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Any County Road 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Stockpile 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Stockpile 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Any County Road 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Stockpile 4.56 0.55 5.11 1

Pick-Up 4.56 ********

Pick-Up Location

Transfer Station

Pickup

1

Cleburne, Texas

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Stabilizer, Magnesium 

Chloride/Molasses

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity:2000

Environtech
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank
Material Delivery

Material + 

Delivery Rank

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Stabilizer, Poly Silicate

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 0

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Precinct #2
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*NOTES
Ergon:

Jaco: 

Quality Hot Mix:  All deliveries are in end dump trailers.  Belly dump trailers can be requested & provided if available.

Cleveland Asphalt Products, INC:

Neumann Welding Inc. : Delivery time is withing 24 hrs f/ order confirmation date and time. 

All prices are based on minimum full load of 5000 gallons, for smaller quanities load you must contact the office. Dliluted material 

can not be returned for credit, returns are for material only. Demurrage:$100/hr adter 2 free hours

Product only comes in 5 gallon Pales. Product is a concentrate that will be mixed with water. 7 day delivery lead time. Delivered to 

Precinct Barns Only

 This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 gallons.  Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a full load of material is not 

ordered. Pump and hose charge is $100.00 per load. Demurrage is billed at $100 per hour, after the second hour. Return freight is 

one-half of the common carrier's outgoingtariff rate. Federal Envionmental Fee will be added to bid prices at a rate of $0.00150/gal 

for emulsion loads or $0.49770/ton for asphalt & polyme loads. This fee is not inlcued in the bid price. For equipment ordered but no 

used (loads not cancelled in a timely manner), the carrier may charge up to a $400.00 cancelled load fee which will be paid by the 

customer. 
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**NOTES 

Gravel, Pit Run Precinct 1 requested Rank 1&2 change due to quality of materials. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Processed Flexible Base G All Precincts requested a change due to distance of pick up locations. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Gravel, Screened w/ Red Clay Precinct 1 requested Rank 1,2, & 3 change due to quality of materials for Precinct & pick up. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Limestone, 3/4" to Dust All Precincts requested a change due to distance of pick up locations. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Limestone, 1/12" to 1" All Precincts requested a change due to distance of pick up locations. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Limestone, Dust All Precincts requested a change due to distance of pick up locations. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Limestone, Grade 5, (Ice Rock) All Precincts requested a change due to distance of pick up locations. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Limestone, Non-Coated, Grade 4 All Precincts requested a change due quality to distance of pick up locations. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Limestone, Precoated Grade 4 All Precincts requested a change due to distance of pick up locations. Ranking shows agreed upon rankings. 

Mix, Cold All Precincts requested a changed due to quality of product.  

Mix, Hot All Precincts requested a changed due to quality of product.  

Stabilizer, Sodium Silicate 40+% All Precincts decided they would not consider pick-up bids. 
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